KAVANGO EAST REGIONAL COUNCIL

A T

Executive Summary of Bid Evaluation Report

PROCUREMENT OF MAJOR RENOVATION OF THREE (3) CLASSROOM BLOCK AT GABRIEL MUHULI
CS,BLOCK A

PROCUREMENT REFERENCE NO: W/RFQ/KERC-DOEAC/107/56/2025/2026
Scope of Contract: Procurement of Major Renovation of Three (3) Classroom Block at Gabriel Muhuli CS, Block A

Procurement method used: Request for Sealed Quotation

Date of Invitation of Bids: 16/01/2026

Closing date for submission of bids: 04/02/2026

Date and place of opening of bids: 05/02/2026 at KERC Auditorium
Number of bids received by closing date: Ninety-five (95)

Responsiveness of bids: \




Bidder’ s Name

Pricing at Bid

Responsive or

Reasons why bid is not responsive

Opening N$ not responsive
(Yes/ No)
Godiva Trading Enterprises cc 780 230,91 No Invitation letter incorrect
information
Karoo Construction cc 814 741,19 No Invitation letter incomplete
Andre Young Investment cc 880 276,61 No Price Activity schedule BOQ civil
and electrical works is gancelled
and incomplete Na
Ekuva Technical Solution cc 627 932,61 Yes Yes —+—
Masona Trading cc 746 944,41 Yes Yes —1
Malikelelo Investment cc 776 977,68 No Invitation letter Emcq%\ma
\
Newman and Daddy Investment cc 869 191,94 No Price Activity schedule BOQ
electrical works Eoomﬁ:ﬂo
NNJD Trading Enterprise cc 666 250,33 No Invitation letter incomplete, Price
Activity schedule BOQ civil works
item no 10.5 not initialed
Shikulumbwati Investment cc 778,278.71 No Bid Securing Declaration
incomplete
Ninety Four King Investment cc 763,417.82 No Electrician License. expired
DZM Investment cc 993,057.52 Yes Yes
Taider Trading Investment cc 793,666.25 No Practical Completion Certificates.
not attached(not related works)
Kanyiki Investment cc 783,564.21 Yes Yes




Mount Zion Trading (PTY) Ltd 949,622.29 No Price Activity schedule
incomplete,
Electrician License not attached

SEMC Trading Enterprises cc 765,457.93 Yes Yes ]

Fonicy Investment cc 788,960.08 Yes Yes

Blessing Zetweni Investment cc 824,629.34 Yes Yes

Msipili Trading Enterprise cc 1,024,295.37 Yes Yes

Wispa Investment cc 760,197.30 No Validity of Quotation less than 90
days %

Gevolt Investment cc 793,049.75 Yes Yes

Pantherline Technical Services cc 736,986.18 Yes Yes

JR Exclusive Investment cc 977,654.89 Yes Yes N

Kaanda Technical Investments cc , No Bid Securing Declaration
incomplete, ,.___
Good Standing BIPA police
stamp copy

Mwangole Investment cc 725,376.04 Yes Yes

Nictra Investment cc 728,846.69 No Price Activity schedule
incomplete,
Practical Completion Certificates
one attached

Twazako Trading cc 684,883.40 Yes Yes

Sempeka Trading cc 776,977.68 No Invitation letter incomplete




Chisafu Trading cc 710,552.10 Yes Yes
Panduleni Construction cc 679,841.93 Yes Yes
Kokas Investment cc 759,663.56 No Invitation  letter  incomplete,
Special ~ Conditions  (GCC6)
incomplete
Efolo & Son Investment cc 751,536.15 No Invitation letter incomplete,
J Muko Trading cc 776,982.40 No Invitation letter incomplete
Albama Investment Group cc 933,004.89 Yes Yes
/
Benguela Trading cc 737,991.38 Yes Yes [l ]
Omuthiya Technologies cc 725,198.46 Yes Yes <
IWS Trading cc N$725,170.66 Yes Yes
N$808,350.42 No Price %8? schedule
Bazalwani Benkosi Investments cc JV incomplete, '
St Blueladder Investment cc
Ngola and Sons Investment cc N$1,150,863.38 Yes Yes
BNG Investment cc N$855,145.96 Yes Yes
N$810,665.02 No Bid Securing Declaration,incorrect
information
Roha Investment cc
Black Bear Trading Enterprises cc N$725,170.68 Yes Yes
Capree Investment cc N$898,665.73 No Invitation letter incomplete, Price
Activity schedule incomplete
Nondunge Eparu Trading cc N$888,234.14 Yes Yes




789,075.20 No Invitation letter incomplete
Pigeon Industries cc
910,453.30 No Practical Completion Certificates
one attached
Rupare Investment cc
874,799.51 Yes Yes
Ezazu Investment cc
771,165.00 No Quotation letter incomplete, Bid
Securing Declaration no company
seal, Price Activity schedulg BOQ
civil works 10.8 tof/ 10.9
incomplete
Hersouzah Trading Enterprise cc =
1,510,548.52 No Invitation letter incomplkte, Price
Activity  schedule ' incomplete,
Special  Condition | (GCC6)
incomplete .
Didoshah Constrcution cc
Touch Pac Investment cc 999,021.60 No Invitation letter incomplete, Price
Activity schedule BOQ civil works
item 5.5 incomplete, Electrician
License not attached
913,044.30 Yes Yes
Moshipya Building Construction cc
906,938.30 No Good Standing BIPA expired
Vilhouse Trading cc
789,742.82 No Bid Securing Declaration not

Kweni-Pewa Trading cc

initialed, Price Activity schedule.
BOQ civil works 2.11 not initialed




646,974.79 No Electrician License. not attached
D-Raq Trading Enterprise cc
1,180,672.29 Yes Yes
GNT Investment cc
718,353.95 No Price Activity schedule BOQ civil
works two different amounts
reflecting, certified ID copy of
company owner. not attached
MRA Investment cc
620,160.17 No Quotation  letter  incomplete,
Special ~ Conditions  (GCC6)
incomplete
Mudjanima Investments cc .
629,790.52 Yes Yes
TS Kayone Trading Enterprises cc -
765,457.93 Yes Yes
Noutak Investments cc
Afripia Investment cc 962,371.63 No Bid Securin Declaration
incomplete
Practical Completion Certificates.
not certified
853,265.72 No Cover page, incomplete, Practical
Completion Certificates. one
attached
Ronga Investment cc
Gongameni Trading cc 760,951.51 No Invitation letter incomplete
Otter Investment cc 828,044.84 No Invitation letter incomplete
Especkey Trading Enterprise cc 869,591.46 No Invitation letter incomplete

Practical Completion Certificates.
one attached




Ziindje Trading cc 782,628.57 No Electrician License expired
Incomparable Trading cc 911,348.36 No Price Activity schedule incomplete
Kangikama Trading cc 874,000 No Practical Completion Certificates
one attached
Longo Investment cc 743,218.88 No Quotation letter, incomplete,
Good Standing BIPA Expired
785,957.71 No Invitation letter incomplete,
Validity of Quotation less than 90
days
AAF Trading cc
844,071.22 No Price Activity schedule BOQ civil
works item 8.4 incomplete,
Electrician License not attached
Best Trading cc
725,187.23 Yes Yes
Disharas Trading Enterprise cc A
1,327,614.00 No Bid  Securing  Declaration
incomplete
Nue-zongombe General Dealer cc N
760,951.51 No Invitation letter incomplete
Soaring Daily Trading cc
863,646.21 Yes Yes
Ancient Investment cc
666,801.20 Yes Yes

Nuuyo Investment Services cc




Namibian Freshness (PTY) Ltd

1,503,609.60

No

Price Activity schedule
incomplete, Price Activity
schedule BOQ electrical works
item no 8.1 correction not initialed

First Lady Trading cc

787,615.92

Yes

Yes

Nkurenkuru Construction cc

771,289.58

No

Special ~ Conditions  (GCC6)
incomplete,
Practical Completion Certificates
not attached

Washampa Investment cc

990,569.72

Invitation letter incomplete
, Price Activity schedule
incomplete, Special Conditions

Shashi Electric cc

1,034,179.89

Yes

(GCC6) incomplete \

Yes

ELE Trading cc

649,094.39

No

Price Activity moro&:_o BOQ civil
works incomplete, certified ID
copy of company owner not
attached, Practical Completion
Certificates. not attached

SMEK Trading Enterprises cc

730,261.01

No

Electrician License not attached

Togetherness Investment cc

1,000,367.34

Yes

Yes

Yando Investment cc

813,390.30

Bid Securing Declaration
incomplete




Amename Civil & Electrical 653,245.76 Yes Yes
Construction cc
908,755.15 Yes Yes
Bradoc Trading Enterprises cc
805,626.88 No Certified copy of ID for the
company owner not attached
Hingo Investment cc
1,133,655.43 No Practical Completion Certificates
one attached
Sinena Investment cc
1,014,908.83 No Invitation letter, incorrect
information, Bid Securing
Declaration incomplete
Oume Construction cc
957,162.79 No Practical Completion Certificates.
not attached, Electrician License.
not attached
Oshitutu Investment cc
1,203,214.50 No Price Activity schedule correction
Jouzy Investment cc not initialed
759,511.87 No Practical Completion Certificates
not attached
H. Liah Investment cc -
1,054,596.00 Yes Yes
Mansa Amari Trading Enterprises cc N
965,654.20 Yes Yes W |
Lyampuku Investment cc N\ |
781,758.74 Yes Yes
Bright Rose Investment cc
781,755.74 No Price Activity schedule. BOQ civil

Vasiku Trading cc

works item no 10.2 and 3.5
incomplete




7. Price comparison for bids that are substantially responsive:

Name A. Price at Bid B. Bid Price after Rank

Opening N$ corrections
Ekuva Technical Solution cc 627,932.61 627,932.61 1.

629,790,52 29,790, .
TS Kayone Trading Enterprises cc 629,790,52 2
Amename Civil & Electrical 653,245.76 653,245.76 3.
Construction cc

i 666,801.20 666,801.20 4,

Nuuyo Investment Services cc
Panduleni Construction cc 679,841.93 679,841.93 5.
Twazako Trading cc 684,883.40 684,883.40 6.
Chisafu Trading cc 710,552.10 710,552.10 7.
IWS Trading cc 725,170.66 725,170.66 8.
Black Bear Trading Enterprises cc | 725,170,68 725,170,68 9.

725,187.23 7251872 =
Disharas Trading Enterprise cc ’ 10. —
Omuthiya Technologies cc 725,198.46 725,198.46 11. / =
Mwangole Investment cc 725,376.04 725,376.04 12.< k __
Pantherline Technical Services cc | 736,986.18 736,986.18 13. __
Benguela Trading cc 737,991.38 737,991.38 14.
Masona Trading cc 746,944 41 746,944 41 15.

765,457.93 765,457.93 16.

SEMC Trading Enterprises cc




765,457.93 765,457.93 17.
Noutak Investments ¢c¢
781,758.74 781,758. .
Bright Rose Investment cc 58.74 18
Kanyiki Investment cc 783,564.21 783,564.21 19,
787,615.92 787,615,
First Lady Trading cc 61592 20.
Fonicy Investment cc 788,960.08 788,960.08 21.
Gevolt Investment cc 793,049.75 793,049.75 22.
Blessing Zetweni Investment cc 824,629.34 824,629.34 23.
855,145.96 855,145,
BNG Investment cc 5% 24.
. 863,646.21 863,646.21 25.
Ancient Investment cc
874,799.51 874,799.51 26.
Ezazu Investment cc )
Nondunge Eparu Trading cc 888,234.14 888,234.14 27.
908,755.15 908,755.1
Bradoc Trading Enterprises cc 08,755.15 28.
913,044.30 13,044. [
Moshipya Building Construction cc 913,044.30 29. |
Albama Investment Group cc 933,004.89 933,004.89 30. _
Pzl
965,654.20 965,654.20 AT~
Lyampuku Investment cc 31 \\\ M\l
JR Exclusive Investment cc 977,654.89 977,654.89 32. <7 ;
DZM Investment cc 993,057.52 993,057.52 33. , \
1,000,367.34 1,000,367.34 34,
Togetherness Investment cc
Msipili Trading Enterprise cc 1,024,295 .37 1,024,295.37 35.
1,034,179.89 ,034,179. .
Shashi Electric cc 1,034,179.89 36
Mansa Amari Trading Enterprises 1,054,596.00 1,054,596.00 37,

CC




Ngola and Sons Investment cc 1,150,863.38 1,150,863.38 38.

GNT Investment cc 1,180,672.29 1,180,672.29 39.

8. Best Evaluated Bid:

The Bid Evaluation Committee recommends to the Procurement Committee that the Bidding Process - W/RFQ/KERC-
DOEAC/107/56/2025/2026- Major Renovation of Three (3) Classroom Block at Gabriel Muhuli CS, Block A be awarded
as per Award Schedule Below:

(The pre-qualification criteria were based on the Bill of Quantities for civil and electrical renovations as provided by

Department of Works inclusive VAT and Contingency)

DESCRIPTION RECOMMENDED BIDDER | BID AMOUNT (N$)

QEOQAHW@,UOH>Q\_cq\mm\ucmm\ucum- MAJOR GNT INVESTMENT CC |'Ns 180,672.29
RENOVATION OF THREE (3) CLASSROOM BLOCK AT
GABRIEL MUHULI CS,BLOCK A

Any further enquiries should be directed to: Kavango East Regional Council: Contact Person Mr. Jona M. Kangumbe at Tel no:

066 266 000. Email: secretarv.cro@kavangorc.gov.na
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