| KAVANGO EAST REGIONAL COUNCIL |

Tel : 066-266 000/266 011 Private Bag 2124
Fax : 066-255396/78 RUNDU

Email :dmuntenda@kavangorc.gov.na NAMIBIA
Enquiries: Davina RN Muntenda 10 June 2026

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

From: KAVANGO EAST REGIONAL COUNCIL

BIDDER REFERENCE NUMBER: W/RFQ/KERC-DOEAC/107/54/2025/2026
W/RFQ/KERC-DOEAC/107/56/2025/2026
W/RFQ/KERC-DOEAC/107/58/2025/2026

SUBJECT: PROCUREMENT OF MAJOR RENOVATION OF THREE (3)
CLASSROOM BLOCK AT NDAMA JP, BLOCK A

PROCUREMENT OF MAJOR RENOVATION OF FIVE (5) CLASSROOM BLOCK
AT NGONE CS, BLOCK A,

PROCUREMENT OF MAJOR RENOVATION OF THREE (3) CLASSROOM
BLOCK AT GABRIEL MUHULI CS, BLOCK A

This notice serves to inform all bidders who participated in the above mentioned bids
that the Notice for selection of Awards and the Executive Summary of Bid Evaluation
Reports, which were uploaded on the Kavango East Regional Council Website on
Friday, 5 June 2026, should be disregarded due an error that was identified and
subsequently corrected.

The corrected Notice for selection of Awards and Executive Summaries have since
been uploaded.

For any further queries please contact the Head of the Procurement Management Unit
and the Procurement Supporting Staff at: 066-266015/066-266011.

s Sincerely
B £psT REGIONZZ
A6Q~  CHIEF
....................... Y. % REGIONAL OFFICER
udgela Nangura A

~ CHIEF REGIONAL OFFICER 717 -05- 1 0

43/[/4_ _ =3
EBAG 2125

All Official Correspondence must be addressed to the Chief Regional Officer



REPUBLIC OF NAMIBIA

KAVANGO EAST REGIONAL COUNCIL

Executive Summary of Bid Evaluation Report
PROCUREMENT OF MAJOR RENOVATION OF THREE (3) CLASSROOM BLOCK AT NDAMA JP, BLOCK A
PROCUREMENT REFERENCE NO: W/RFQ/KERC-DOEAC/107/54/2025/2026
moowm of Contract: Procurement of Major Renovation of Three (3) Classroom Block at Ndama JP, Block A

1. Procurement method used: Request for Sealed Quotation

Date of Invitation of Bids: 16/01/2026

Closing date for submission of bids: 04/02/2026

Date and place of opening of bids: 09/02/2026 at KERC Auditorium
Number of bids received by closing date: Eighty-Five (85)

A



6. Responsiveness of bids:

Bidder’ s Name Pricing at Bid Responsive or not Reasons why bid is not responsive
Opening N$ responsive (Yes/ No)

Ndjukuma Trading cc N$827,340.21 No Section II Quotation letter and Priced
Activity Schedule not initialed and
Affirmative Action Compliance Certificate
expired

Godiva Trading Enterprises cc N$1,182,898.01 No Incorrect information on invitation letter

Karoo Construction cc N$833,192.26 No Invitation letter incomplete, Priced Activity
Schedule BOQ civil item 10.8 and 10.9
missing

Kasote Civil Construction & Electrical cc | N$985,267.32 Yes Yes

Andre Young Investment cc N$974,248.16 No Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil and |
electrical cancelled

Ekuva Technical Solution cc N$697,236.85 No Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil item no
10.8 and 10.9 missipg

Masona Trading cc N$742,334.24 Yes Yes n\h%.w..l;

Malikelelo Investment cc N$774,406.53 No Invitation _Qﬂpo._; incomplete,

Itona Trading cc N$785,681.99 No Page 7,Bid Securing Declaration missing

Shikulumbwati Investment cc N$754,382.52 No Company Registration Certificate page 3,not

attached
Ninety Four King Investment cc N$769,459.69 No Priced Activity Schedule incomplete
DZM Investment cc N$1,023,839.83 Yes Yes




Rutando Investments cc N$880,140.20 Yes Yes

Sepes General Enterprises cc N$841,525.08 No Invitation letter page 2 incomplete, Special
Conditions page 14 (GCC6) incomplete

Taider Trading Investment cc N$708,126.64 No Priced Activity Schedule B 2.d. BOQ civil,
item no. 10.8 and 10.9 missing

Kanyiki Investment cc N$827,340.21 No Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil, item no.
10.8 and 10.9 missing

Jaynathi Investment cc N$832,303.17 Yes Yes

Mount Zion Trading (PTY) Ltd N$684,748.30 No Priced activity schedule, page 11
incomplete

SEMC Trading Enterprises cc N$762,454.73 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7,missing

Fonicy Investment cc N$813,797.50 Yes Yes

Omtata Investment cc N$607,227.08 No Bid Securing Declaration incomplete,
Priced activity schedule incomplete,
Priced activity schedule BOQ civil item no
10.8 and 10.9 incomplete, BOQ electrical
item no 7.3 incgmplete and electrician
license not attacheq

- ~ _ﬂ_

Ndafi Trading Investment cc N$1,003,043.08 No Bid Securfig |Declaration incomplete,
Priced Activity mmn.:oac_o incomplete, Priced
Activity Schedulg BOQ civil item no 10.8 to
10.9 missing Voo
and one attached practical completion
certificate

Blessings Zetweni Investment cc N$940,073.83 No Priced Activity Schedule. BOQ civil, item

10.7 and 10.8 missing and one attached
practical completion certificate




Msipili Trading Enterprise cc N$917,276.42 No Section II Quotation letter incomplete,

Sasomo Investment cc N$903,927.53 No Priced Activity Schedule. BOQ civil item no
6.5 incomplete

Wispa Investment cc N$731,955.27 Yes Yes

Finway Investment cc N$1,805,326.88 No Priced Activity Schedule incomplete, Priced
Activity Schedule BOQ item no 10.7 to 10.9

Gevolt Investment cc N$866,197.50 Yes Yes

Tuhungeni Pamwe Investment cc N$826,426.23 No Priced Activity Schedule,incomplete

Pantherline Technical Services cc N$939,859.97 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7,missing

JR Exclusive Investment cc N$1,034,741.04 Yes Yes

Brightrose Investment cc N$762,507.05 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7 missing,
, Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil item no
1.5 correction not initidled, Priced Activity
Schedule BOQ civil / tem 10.8 and 10.9
missing FE—

Kaanda Technical Investment cc N$770,570.93 No Priced >o@<#w\wﬂ&awh_o BOQ civil item no
10.8 and 10.9 missing and
BIPA good standing riot certified

N

Vasiku Trading cc N$762,507.05 No Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil item
10.8 and 10.9 missing

Mwangole Investment cc N$775,503.42 Yes Yes

Fuda Life Investment cc N$703,160.45 Yes Yes

Nictra Investment cc N$729,886.29 No Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil and
electrical incomplete

Twazako Trading cc N$720,096.14 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7,missing




Sempeka Trading cc N§$772,816.42 | No Invitation letter incomplete,
N$ 723,004.47 Yes Yes
Panduleni Construction cc - ]
N$804,813.32 Yes Yes
Alteda Investment cc B B
Kokas Investment cc N$ 804,909.57 No Invitation letter incomplete, Bid Securing
Declaration page 7 missing, , Special
Conditions page 14 (GCC6) incomplete,
Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil item no
10.8 to 10.9 missing
Khama Trading Enterprise cc N$804,909.57 No Invitation letter incomplete, Priced Activity
Schedule BOQ civil item 10.8 and 10.9
missing
Albama Investment Group cc N$860,027.95 Yes Yes
N$ 762,662.40 No Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil, item no
10.8 and 10.9 missing
Benguela Trading cc
N$ 762,454.59 Yes Yes
Omuthiya Technologies cc
N§ 828,110.56 No Invitation letter incomplete, Priced Activity
Schedule BOQ/civil item no 10.7 to 10.9 is
Bazalwani Benkosi Investments cc JV ST missing
Blueladder Investment cc -
N$ 974,864.43 Yes Yes
Ngola and Sons Investments cc
N$853,685.12 Yes Yes
BNG Investment cc
Roha Investment cc N$ 587,641.09 No Bid Securing Declaration missing and Priced

Activity Schedule BOQ electrical item no
7.1t0 8.2 incomplete




Nondunge Eparu Trading cc N$823,549.99 Yes Yes
No Invitation letter incorrect information,
N$909,788.27 Section II Quotation letter incomplete, Bid
Securing Declaration page 7 missing, Priced
Activity Schedule BOQ civil item no 10.8 to
10.9 missing
Jeje Trading Enterprise cc
N$784,473.12 No Invitation letter incomplete, Bid Securing
Pigeon Industries cc Declaration page 7,missing
N$756,214.15 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7,missing
one practical completion certificate
attached
Rupare Investment cc
N$918,253.89 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7 incomplete,
Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil item no
Ezazu Investment cc 10.8 and 10.9 missing
N$1,278,464.37 No Invitation letter incomplete incomplete,
incomplete, Special Conditions (GCC6)
incompete, practical completion certificate.
not attached
Didoshah Constrcution cc =
N$899,998.59 Yes Yes \w
Moshipya Building Construction cc 7~ /|
N$729,348.60 No Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil item no
Kweni-Pewa Trading cc 1.10 and 1.11 correction not initialed
N$537,910.34 No Priced Activity Scheédule BOQ electrical
D-Raq Trading Enterprise cc missing,
Mopani Trading cc N$771,755.46 No one practical completion certificate attached
and electrician license not attached
N$618,194.72 No Priced Activity Schedule incomplete and
Mudjanima Investments cc BOQ civil item 10.8 and 10.9 missing
KKV Investment cc N$920,509.26 No Special Conditions (GCC6) incomplete
Priced Activity Schedule incomplete
TS Kayone Trading Enterprises cc N$733,751.26 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7 missing




Gongameni Trading cc N$802,558.46 No Invitation letter incomplete
Ziindje Trading cc N$693,531.40 No Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil last
page missing and electrician license expired
Kangikama Trading cc N$1,045,000.96 No Practical completion certificate not attached
Disharas Trading Enterprise cc N$764,479.99 Yes Yes
Nuuyo Investment Services cc N$705,653.61 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7 missing and
Priced Activity Schedule incomplete
N$946,146.00 No Priced Activity Schedule incomplete
Namibian Freshness (PTY) Ltd \
Togetherness Investment cc N$836,825.93 Yes Yes \
N$847,042.06 Yes Yes =4
Hingo Investment cc =~
Sinena Investment cc ) N$1,047,176.45 Yes Yes /]
N$996,409.16 No Bid Securing Déclaration page 7 missing,
ITB Priced Attivity Schedule incomplete
one Practical cgmpletion certificate attached
Oume Construction cc
N$976,574.40 No Practical completion certificate not attached
Mansa Amari Trading Enterprises cc
N$876,413.00 No Invitation letter incorrect information,
Section II Quotation letter incomplete,Bid
Lyampuku Investment cc Securing Declaration page 7 missing
N$1,135,956.26 Yes Yes
Dammah Trading Enterprises cc
Invitation letter incomplete, Bid Securing
Declaration page 7 incomplete, Special
Conditions  (GCC6)  incomplete,good
No standing BIPA not attached and Practical

Himee’s Trading Enterprises cc

N$820,726.72

completion certificate not attached




Okani Investment cc

N$714,142.02 Yes Yes
Coskem Investment cc
N$866,947.83 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7 missing,
Tethys Investments cc
Pellow Trading cc N$764,075.79 Yes Yes
N$762,454.70 No Priced Activity Schedule BOQ civil item no
10.7 to 10.9 incomplete
electrician license wrong attachment
El Grind Investments cc
N$941,267.15 No Bid Securing Declaration page 7 missing,
Kratos Investment cc Special Conditions (GCC6) incomplete
N§$ 878,823.23 Yes Yes
Chisafu Trading cc
N$2,194,253.20 No Affirmative Action Compliance Certificate
expired
Avory Trading cc
N$869,165.00 No Electrician license expired

A
7. Price comparison for bids that are substantially responsive: \\\\m@l
Name A. Price at Bid Opening N$ | B. Bid Price maﬁ.\&m_.mq:c:m Rank
Fuda Life Investment cc 703,160.45 703,160.45 /\ 1.
714,142.02 714,142.02 / 2.
Coskem Investment cc A
. ) 723,004.47 723,004.47 3.
Panduleni Construction cc
Wispa Investment cc 731,955.27 731,955.27 4,
Masona Trading cc 742,334.24 742,334.24 5.
. ) 762,454.59 762,454.59 6.
Omuthiya Technologies cc ]




. 764,075.79 764,075.79 7.
Pellow Trading cc
Disharas Trading Enterprise cc 764,479.99 764,479.99 8.
Jaynathi Investment cc 765,720.13 765,720.13 9.
Mwangole Investment cc 775,503.42 775,503.42 10.
804,813.32 804,813.32 11.
Alteda Investment cc
Fonicy Investment cc 813,797.50 813,797.50 12.
. 823,549.99 823,549.99 13.
Nondunge Eparu Trading cc
836,825.93 836,825.93 14.
Togetherness Investment cc
} 847,042.06 847,042.06 15.
Hingo Investment cc
853,685.12 853,685.12 16.
BNG Investment cc
Albama Investment Group cc 860,027.95 860,027.95 * 17.
Gevolt Investment cc 866,197.50 866,197.50 !.~k\\ 18.
878,823.23 878,823.23 ? .
Chisafu Trading cc \m_\\\\\ 19
Rutando Investments cc 880,140.20 880,140.20 ¢\ 20.
. o . 899,998.59 899,998.59 21.
Moshipya Building Construction cc .
974,864.43 974,864.43 22.
Ngola and Sons Investments cc
Kasote Civil Construction & Electrical cc | 985,267.32 985,267.32 23.
DZM Investment cc 1,023,839.83 1,023,839.83 24,
JR Exclusive Investment cc 1,034,741.04 1,034,741.04 25.
. 1,047,176.45 1,047,176.45 26.
Sinena Investment cc
1,135,956.26 1,135,956.26 27.

Dammah Trading Enterprises cc




8. Best Evaluated Bid:
The Bid Evaluation Committee recommends to the Procurement Committee that the Bidding Process - W/RFQ/KERC-

DOEAC/107/54/2025/2026- Procurement of Major Renovation of Three (3) Classroom Block at Ndama JP, Block A be

awarded as per Award Schedule Below:
(The pre-qualification criteria were based on the Bill of Quantities for civil and electrical renovations as provided by

Department of Works inclusive VAT and Contingency)

DESCRIPTION RECOMMENDED BIDDER | BID AMOUNT (N$)
W/RFQ/KERC-DOEAC/107/54/2025/2026- g?-OW, ) | DAMMAH TRADING NS$ 1, 306,349.70
RENOVATION OF THREE (3) CLASSROOM BLOCK AT ENTERPRISES CC

NDAMA JP, BLOCK A

Any further enquiries should be directed to: Kavango East Regional Council: Contact Person Mr. Jona M. Kangumbe at Tel no:

066 266 000. Email: secretary.cro@kavangore,gov.na

“Ms. Ludgela Nangura _ 1<) Date
O-,:nﬂﬂwm?:m_ Officer A\ < / \



